
Bessie C. Bain

Bessie C. Bain, 82, McConnells
burg, died Friday morning, February
15, 1991 in the Chambersburg
Hospital.

Born October 1, 1908 in Ayr Town
ship, Fulton County, she was the
daughter of the late Elmer and Ellie
Shaffer Seiders.

She was a member of the Open
Door Church, Chambersburg and
attended the McConnellsburg Senior
Citizens Center.

In 1925, she married John Bain. He
preceded her in death in January 1971.

Surviving are a daughter, Betty
(Mrs. William) Lewis of McConnells
burg; three sons: Donald of Mercers-
burg; Carl of McConnellsburg and
Harry of Needmore; a sister, Martha
(Mrs. John) McQuadc of McConnells
burg; two brothers: Paul Seiders of
Martinsburg, PA and Chester Seiders
of McConnellsburg; II grandchildren
and 11 great-grandchildren. Two sis
ters and a grandson preceded her in
death.

Services were held at 11:00 a.m.
Monday, February 18 at the
Kelso/Cornelius Funeral Home. The

Rev. Jerry Traister officiated. Burial
was made in Union Cemetery.


